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What is 2020 Going to be Remembered for? 
 

Our Goal: What is God saying to us during these times? 
 

Numbers 13:17-30 (NIV) 
 

“When Moses sent them to explore Canaan, he said, ‘Go up through the Negev and on into the hill 
country. See what the land is like and whether the people who live there are strong or weak, few or 
many. What kind of land do they live in? Is it good or bad? What kind of towns do they live in? Are 
they unwalled or fortified? How is the soil? Is it fertile or poor? Are there trees in it or not? Do your 
best to bring back some of the fruit of the land.’… So they went up and explored the land from the 
Desert of Zin as far as Rehob, toward Lebo Hamath. They went up through the Negev and came to 
Hebron, where Ahiman, Sheshai and Talmai, the descendants of Anak, lived… When they reached the 
Valley of Eshkol, they cut off a branch bearing a single cluster of grapes. Two of them carried it on a 
pole between them, along with some pomegranates and figs. That place was called the Valley of 
Eshkol because of the cluster of grapes the Israelites cut off there. At the end of forty days they 
returned from exploring the land. They came back to Moses and Aaron and the whole Israelite 
community at Kadesh in the Desert of Paran. There they reported to them and to the whole assembly 
and showed them the fruit of the land. They gave Moses this account: ‘We went into the land to which 
you sent us, and it does flow with milk and honey! Here is its fruit.  But the people who live there are 
powerful, and the cities are fortified and very large. We even saw descendants of Anak there. The 
Amalekites live in the Negev; the Hittites, Jebusites and Amorites live in the hill country; and the 
Canaanites live near the sea and along the Jordan.’ Then Caleb silenced the people before Moses and 
said, ‘We should go up and take possession of the land, for we can certainly do it.’” 
 
 

3 Keys Areas to Consider:  
 

1) Be a ___________________ of Jesus 
 

“At that time some Pharisees came to Jesus and said to him, ‘Leave this place and go somewhere else. 
Herod wants to kill you.’ He replied, ‘Go tell that fox, “I will keep on driving out demons and healing 
people today and tomorrow, and on the third day I will reach my goal.” In any case, I must press on 
today and tomorrow and the next day—for surely no prophet can die outside Jerusalem!’” 
Luke 13:31-33 (NIV) 
 
2) ___________________ 
  

 Challenge: Go a mile deep with a few people!   
 

“‘So tell them, “As surely as I live, declares the Lord, I will do to you the very thing I heard you 
say”…’” Numbers 14:28 (NIV) 
 

“From the fruit of their mouth a person’s stomach is filled; with the harvest of their lips they are 
satisfied.  The tongue has the power of life and death, and those who love it will eat its fruit.” 
Proverbs 18:20-21 (NIV) 
 

“Likewise, the tongue is a small part of the body, but it makes great boasts. Consider what a great 
forest is set on fire by a small spark.” James 3:5 (NIV) 
 
3) Who is the new __________________________? 
 
 

Big Idea: 
 

We must consider these 3 areas because we are called 
to be ministers of the new covenant. 

 

“But thanks be to God, who... uses us to spread the aroma of the knowledge of him everywhere. For 
we are to God the pleasing aroma of Christ among those who are being saved and those who are 
perishing.” 2 Corinthians 2:14-15 (NIV) 
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